

CENTRAL STOCKYARDS

03/18/2021 10:00 CT Fed Cattle Exchange Auction Results

Total Head Count: 1,270 offered, 0 hd sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: Heifers NA; Steers \$NA

TX/OK/NM Hd Count: 895 offered, 0 hd sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: Heifers NA; Steers NA

KS Hd Count:152 offered, 0 hd sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

NE Hd Count: 223 head offered, 0 head sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

IA Head Count: 0 head offered, 0 head sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

CO Head Count: 0 head offered, 0 head sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

Outside 5 Area Head Count: 0 head offered, 0 head sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

<u>Sale Date</u>	<u>Listing</u>	<u>Sold/No Sale</u>	<u>Marketing Method</u>	<u>Opening Price</u>	<u>Reserve Price</u>	<u>Sale Price</u>	<u>High Bid</u>	<u>Seller Action</u>	<u>Head</u>	<u>Sex</u>	<u>Out Weight</u>	<u>Dressed %</u>	<u>% Choice +</u>	<u>Origin</u>	<u>State</u>	<u>Seller</u>	<u>Feedyard</u>
3/18/2021	277	No Sale	Live Weight	\$113.00	\$116.00	No Sale	\$113.50	N/A	199	Fed Heifers	1154	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	TX	5 Rivers Cattle feeding	XIT Feedyard
3/18/2021	282	No Sale	Live Weight	\$80.00	\$95.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	40	Fed Heifers	1375	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	KS	Kroenke Farms	Rocking E Feedyard
3/18/2021	286	No Sale	Live Weight	\$113.00	\$115.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	37	Other	1425	63.5	75	United States	KS	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC
3/18/2021	280	No Sale	Bid-The-Grid™	\$113.25	\$116.00	No Sale	\$113.25	N/A	188	Fed Heifers	1200	64.75	75	United States	TX	Friona Industries	Friona Feedyard
3/18/2021	278	No Sale	Live Weight	\$113.00	\$116.00	No Sale	\$113.75	N/A	195	Fed Heifers	1163	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	TX	5 Rivers Cattle feeding	XIT Feedyard
3/18/2021	279	No Sale	Bid-The-Grid™	\$113.00	\$115.25	No Sale	\$113.00	N/A	223	Fed Steers	1425	63.5	Not Submitted	United States	NE	Arcadia Commodity Opportunity	Hiene Farms
3/18/2021	281	No Sale	Bid-The-Grid™	\$113.00	\$116.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	116	Fed Heifers	1265	64.75	75	United States	TX	Friona Industries	Friona Feedyard
3/18/2021	287	No Sale	Bid-The-Grid™	\$113.00	\$114.50	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	38	Other	1275	63.5	75	United States	KS	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC
3/18/2021	285	No Sale	Live Weight	\$113.00	\$115.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	37	Other	1500	63.25	75	United States	KS	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC
3/18/2021	284	No Sale	Live Weight	\$113.00	\$116.00	No Sale	\$113.50	N/A	98	Fed Steers	1325	63.5	Not Submitted	United States	TX	5 Rivers Cattle feeding	Coronado Feedyard
3/18/2021	283	No Sale	Live Weight	\$113.00	\$115.00	No Sale	\$113.25	N/A	99	Fed Steers	1380	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	TX	Cactus Feeders	Cactus Feedyard

1270