

CENTRAL STOCKYARDS

05/12/2021 10:00 CT Fed Cattle Exchange Auction Results

Total Head Count: 2,469 offered, 1,588 hd sold (1,114 heifers, 474 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: \$119.93

TX/OK/NM Hd Count: 1,432 offered, 1,158 hd sold (882 heifers, 276 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: \$119.97

KS Hd Count: 254 offered, 68 hd sold (68 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: \$120.00

NE Hd Count: 783 head offered, 362 head sold (232 heifers, 130 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: \$119.82

IA Head Count: 0 head offered, 0 head sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

CO Head Count: 0 head offered, 0 head sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

Outside 5 Area Head Count: 0 head offered, 0 head sold (0 heifers, 0 steers)
Weighted Avg Sales Price: N/A

Sale Date	Listing	Sold/No Sale	Marketing Method	Opening Price	Reserve Price	Sale Price	High Bid	Seller Action	Head	Sex	Out Weight	Dressed %	% Choice +	Origin	State	Seller	Feedyard
5/12/2021	531	Sold	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$119.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	N/A	82	Fed Steers	1295	64.8	65	United States	TX	Champion Feeders LLC	Champion Feeders
3/31/2021	528	No Sale	Live Weight	\$119.00	\$120.00	No Sale	\$119.00	N/A	198	Fed Heifers	1260	63.5	Not Submitted	United States	TX	Five Rivers Cattle	Coronado Feedyard
3/31/2021	540	No Sale	Live Weight	\$119.00	\$120.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	76	Other	1275	64	80	United States	NE	Diamond 6 Feedyard	Diamond 6 Feedyard
3/31/2021	523	Sold	Bid-The-Grid™	\$118.50	\$121.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	Reserve Lifted	232	Fed Heifers	1350	63.5	70	United States	NE	Reigle Cattle Co	Reigle Cattle Co
3/31/2021	519	Sold	Live Weight	\$119.00	\$118.25	\$120.00	\$120.00	N/A	149	Fed Heifers	1200	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	TX	Five Rivers Cattle	XIT Feedyard
3/31/2021	532	Sold	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$119.00	\$119.25	\$119.25	N/A	96	Fed Steers	1250	64.8	65	United States	TX	Champion Feeders LLC	Champion Feeders
3/31/2021	521	Sold	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$120.00	\$120.25	\$120.25	N/A	199	Fed Heifers	1290	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	TX	Cactus Feeders	Stratford Feedyard
3/31/2021	525	No Sale	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$119.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	39	Other	1340	63.5	75	United States	KS	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC
3/31/2021	535	Sold	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	N/A	68	Fed Steers	1336	63.5	Not Submitted	United States	KS	Acradia Commodity Opportunity	Hy Plains Feedyard
3/31/2021	530	Sold	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$119.00	\$119.50	\$119.50	N/A	98	Fed Steers	1295	64.9	65	United States	TX	Champion Feeders LLC	Champion Feeders
3/31/2021	524	No Sale	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$120.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	179	Fed Heifers	1300	63.5	80	United States	NE	Reigle Cattle Co	Reigle Cattle Co
3/31/2021	539	No Sale	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$120.00	No Sale	\$118.50	N/A	166	Other	1250	64	80	United States	NE	Diamond 6 Feedyard	Diamond 6 Feedyard
3/31/2021	526	No Sale	Live Weight	\$118.00	\$120.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	36	Other	1400	63.5	70	United States	KS	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC
3/31/2021	520	Sold	Live Weight	\$118.25	\$118.25	\$120.25	\$120.25	N/A	128	Fed Heifers	1220	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	TX	Five Rivers Cattle	XIT Feedyard
3/31/2021	536	No Sale	Bid-The-Grid™	\$118.50	\$120.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	75	Other	1325	Not Submitted	Not Submitted	United States	KS	Kovanda Cattle Co	Pratt Feeders
3/31/2021	534	Sold	Bid-The-Grid™	\$118.50	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	N/A	255	Fed Heifers	1295	64.75	75	United States	TX	Friona Industries	Friona Feedyard
3/31/2021	529	No Sale	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$119.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	76	Fed Steers	1250	64.9	65	United States	TX	Champion Feeders LLC	Tascosa Feedyard
3/31/2021	522	No Sale	Live Weight	\$117.50	\$120.00	No Sale	No Bid	N/A	36	Other	1360	63.5	70	United States	KS	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC	Lindsey Creek Feeders LLC
3/31/2021	533	Sold	Bid-The-Grid™	\$118.50	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$120.00	N/A	151	Fed Heifers	1250	64.75	75	United States	TX	Friona Industries	Friona Feedyard
3/31/2021	541	Sold	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$120.00	\$119.50	\$119.50	Reserve Lifted	130	Fed Steers	1375	64	80	United States	NE	Diamond 6 Feedyard	Diamond 6 Feedyard
3/31/2021	542	Scratched / Relist	Live Weight	Scratched	Scratched	Scratched	Scratched	Scratched	0	Scratched	N/A	Scratched	65	United States	TX	Champion Feeders LLC	Champion Feeders
3/31/2021	543	No Sale / Relist	Live Weight	\$118.50	\$120.00	No Sale	\$118.50	N/A	198	Fed Heifers	1260	63.5	Not Submitted	United States	TX	Five Rivers Cattle	Coronado Feedyard

2667